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School Communication Policy 

Introduction  

Good communication is much more than the exchange of information. It is through effective and 
interactive communication that information is transmitted, understanding is developed and shared, 
trust is built, confidentiality respected and action coordinated. Communication includes not only the 
message but also how that message is communicated. Good communication promotes partnership. 
We believe through good communication we also share our Christian Values. 

Aim  

To ensure that Thurlaston CE (Aided) Primary School is a thriving and successful school, we must 
communicate effectively with each other, with our pupils, with their parents and with other 
members of the wider community. We need to ensure that communications between all members 
of the school community are clear, professional, timely and appropriate.  

Objectives  

All communications at Thurlaston CE (Aided) Primary School should:  

• Keep staff, pupils, parents, and stakeholders well informed. 

 • Be open, honest, ethical and professional.  

• Be jargon free and easily understood by all.  

• Be actioned within a reasonable time.  

• Use the methods of communication most effective and appropriate to the context, message and 
audience.  

• Take account of relevant school policies.  

 

Methods and considerations 

Newsletters 

School will produce regular newsletters to inform the school community of upcoming events and 
highlight successes. These will be distributed to all families in print form. They will also be posted on 
the school website. Families who wish to receive this by email may also request it. 

Annual Pupil Reports 

These will be produced annually according to the agreed school format. They will meet legal 
requirements. Teachers will be responsible for writing the report but may get input from other staff 
and agencies. Reports will be read by the headteacher before being distributed. These reports will 
normally be sent out in the summer term but may be sent out at different times in the year if there 
is good reason to do so. 



Parents evenings 

These will be held to share with parents about the progress of their child, any areas of concern and 
how to help their child. Each parent will be allocated a 10 minute slot except for children on the SEN 
register who will have a further 10 minutes to enable the child’s Individual Education Plan to be 
reviewed. All parents will be encouraged to attend. If a parent is unable to attend the parent and 
member of staff will try to schedule another time. It is important to note that school staff have lives 
and responsibilities outside of school and school is limited to what they can expect outside of normal 
school hours. Much work is done by school staff on a goodwill basis. 

Parent initiated communication (Term Time and week day) 

The office staff will answer questions regarding the administration of the school or pass it on to the 
relevant person. Parents will often receive an immediate response but can expect to wait up to and 
including 5 working days. 

Questions regarding teaching, learning and a child’s progress will be dealt with initially by their class 
teacher. Teachers will not be available to take calls or answer emails during lesson time but will 
endeavour to answer when time permits. Parents can expect to receive answers within 5 working 
days. If it is not possible to answer with in that timeframe the parent will be contacted and will have 
explained what has happened and what will happen next. 

Parent Initiated Communication (Outside of term time and at weekends) 

When school is closed to children the telephone will not be answered and there is no way of leaving 
messages. 

Email and postal communication will only be checked once a fortnight or the next working day. If the 
matter is pressing it may be answered if possible, otherwise it will be dealt with when school 
reopens to children. 

Staff Initiated Communication 

Staff will only use the school phone (or mobile) or their school email address to communicate to 
parents or in person. Staff should only use official school communication channels. Staff should be 
aware of our Social Media Policy and Safer working practices in particular they should not accept 
friend requests from parents (or grandparents), pupils or ex-pupils.  

Meetings with Parents 

These will normally take place in school hours. This provides for the children to be cared for and for 
the school staff to be available. Meetings may take place outside of school hours by mutual 
agreement but this is incumbent on the good will of the staff. 

Complaints 

Should a parent have a complaint they should follow the school complaints procedure. Please see 
separate policy. 


